4 FVN Group 5 - Extended Length Window Van - 9100 |Ib. GVWR minumum

EXTENDED FULL SIZE PASSENGER WINDOW VAN w/15 PASSENGER SEATING: Base Engine, Automatic

Transmission.

Line |Base Vehicle Minimum Specifications State Package or
Number Code Number
Line 1 [Wheelbase: 138 or 155 inches. Overall length minimum 223 inches. 138
Line 2 [9,100 Ib. GVWR minimum. STATE GVWR 9100 & Payload Capacity 2640 204
Engine: Base engine for model bid with specified options and accessories. If base is available as E85 flex-fuel, it 99L
Line 3 [must be provided. STATE: Cylinders__8 Liters__ 5.4 Horsepower 255  Torque _ 350
Line 4  [Air conditioning w/all required options. std
Line 5 [Auxiliary rear heater and air conditioning. Controls accessible/operable to/by rear occupants. std
Line 6 [Tilt steering column, automatic speed control. std
Line 7 [Wipers, intermittent. std
Line 8 [Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes. std
Line 9 [Power point. std
Line 10 [Power windows. std
Line 11 [Radio, AM FM w/internal clock. Delete satellite radio if standard. std
Line 12 [Daytime running lamps. 942
Line 13 [Power door locks with remote keyess entry. 948
Fifteen passenger seating. Front captain chair seats, three 3-person and one 4-person quick release bench seats, 21N
Line 14 [all w/cloth upholstery. Folding arm rests on both captains chairs and all 3-passenger seats on door end, if
available.
Line 15 Full floor covering, rubber preferred - if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor 162/ 163
mats must be provided for all seat positions
Line 16 IFuII factory wagon insulations/trim package, to include door/side wall panels, full headliner, front and rear dome std
amps.
Line 17 [All passenger area windows dark tinted. Operable for ventilation if possible. 924
Line 18 [Side cargo doors, swinging dual. std
Line 19 [Rear cargo doors, swinging dual. std
Line 20 [Rear axle, anti-spin differential. na
Line 21 [Stability Control System. std
Line 22 [Tires, all-season radials. Full size spare tire. std
Line 23 [Rear bumper. std
Line 24 [Delete vehicle communication system (OnStar or equivalent) if standard. na
Line 25 BASE VEHICLE PRICE CONFIGURED AS PER ABOVE $23,377.00
Line 26 Delivery Charge. Per mile charge for anywhere in the State of lowa. Use $0.00 format $1.00
Options List - Dealer must provide price for each option. (prices are required to complete Bid - | State Package or} Option Price 1
if standard state STD, if part of a package state package code, if not available state N/A, if dealer installed/provided state DLR, if Code Number M be
cost is a deduct, state as a negative (-) number, if cost is zero (0), enter '0'".) provided
Line 27 [138 inch wheelbase. Overall length 232 inches - Maximum height not to exceed 85 inches. na $0.00
Line 28 [155 inch wheelbase. Overall length 244 inches - Maximum height not to exceed 83 inches. na $0.00
Line 29 [Engine block heater. 41H $75.00
Line 30 [Power mirrors. std $0.00
Line 31 [Vinyl upholstery in lieu of cloth. na $0.00
Line 32 [Chrome Bumpers std $0.00
Line 33 [Paint: DOT Orange. GM 9W4, Ford W5684E, Dodge TY5262. na $0.00
. Two passenger seating only - front capatin chairs with folding arm rests. Delete any passenger area (2nd , 3rd or
Line 34 L S . . $0.00
additional) row side impact air bags. no bid
Five passenger seating. Front captain chair seats, one quick-release 3-passenger bench seat directly behind, all
Line 35 |with cloth upholstery. Folding arm rests on both captains chairs and all 3-passenger seats on door end, if $0.00
available. no bid
Eight passenger seating. Front captain chair seats, two quick-release 3-passenger bench seats directly behind, all
Line 36 |with cloth upholstery. Folding arm rests on both captains chairs and all 3-passenger seats on door end, if $0.00
available. no bid
Twelve passenger seating. Front capatain chair seats, two quick-release 3-passenger and one 4-person quick
Line 37 [release bench seats directly behind, all with cloth upholstery. Folding arm rests on both captains chairs and all 3- 21H - 11 pass ($137.00)
passenger seats on door end, if available. only
15-passenger van Split Bench Commuter Package by VPSI. Ship through code 31TD9D and No holes in Floor
Line 38 [Code E54. Prep Code IHD - must state rubber floor Code E6S or carpet floor Code E6T. Contact info: Owen $5,585.00
Murtagh 248-597-3512 VPS|
. Dealer removal of all additional (non-requested) seats and cooresponding seat belt apparatus. Vehicle shall not
Line 39 . . i . . $0.00
be delivered with non-requested seats or belts in it, loose or otherwise. no bid
Line 40 [Side cargo door, sliding. 60S $0.00
Line 41 [Full Floor Carpeting & OEM Mats for all seats if not provided in base above. std $50.00
Line 42 |2 extra key sets, 4 total sets with each vehicle dealer $46.00
Line 43 [Floor mats, 2-auxiliary rubber, fitted. Aftermarket acceptable. dealer $125.00
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4 FVN Group 5 - Extended Length Window Van Options Continued

Line 44 [Full set of OEM shop manuals on CD. dealer $200.00
Line 45 [OEM or dealer installed running boards with matching front and rear (behind tires) mudflaps. 687 $500.00
Line 46 [Trailer tow package - Class IV receiver hitch, 7-wire receptacle at hitch. 536 / 768 $455.00
E85 FFV engine in lieu of base engine - IF AVAILABLE - include all required options and other pertinent
Line 47 [information. STATE: Cylinders Liters Horsepower Torque LIST $0.00
OTHER REQUIREMENTS: na
Line 48 [Reverse sensing alarm system, if available. 43R $280.00
Line 49 [Tire Pressure Monitoring system, if available. std $0.00
Line 50 [DEDUCT COST: Delete anti-lock brakes. na $0.00
Line 51 [DEDUCT COST: Delete Daytime running lights. std ($30.00)
Line 52 [DEDUCT COST: Delete Power windows. na $0.00
Line 53 [DEDUCT COST: Delete Power door locks with remote keyess entry. na $0.00
BID ID: FVYN 5.4 - Ul
Ul Required Options (Prices are required to complete Bid - if standard state STD, if part of a package state package code, if | State Package or| Option Price 1
not available state N/A, if dealer installed/provided state DLR, if cost is a deduct, state as a negative (-) number, if cost is zero Code Number MUST be
(0), enter '0'.) provided
Line 27 [138 inch wheelbase. Overall length 232 inches - Maximum height not to exceed 85 inches. na $0.00
Line 30 [Power mirrors. std $0.00
Line 32 [Chrome Bumpers std $0.00
Line 42 [2 extra key sets, 4 total sets with each vehicle dealer $46.00
Line 44 [Full set of OEM shop manuals on CD. dealer $200.00
Line 45 [OEM or dealer installed running boards with matching front and rear (behind tires) mudflaps. 687 $500.00
E85 FFV engine in lieu of base engine - IF AVAILABLE - include all required options and other pertinent
Line 47 [information. STATE: Cylinders Liters Horsepower Torque LIST na $0.00
OTHER REQUIREMENTS:
Line 48 [Reverse sensing alarm system, if available. 43R $280.00
Line 49 [Tire Pressure Monitoring system, if available. std $0.00
Estimated Quantity: 5
Delivered FOB: University of lowa, lowa City. Delivery Delivery
Delivery Cost - Enter miles in whole number, MapQuest city to city - Miles Cost
Line 60 Cost will be automatically calculated 0 $0.00
Line 61 TOTAL PRICE EACH: Add Base Cost, Options, and Delivery Cost $24,403.00
Below Information Must Be Provided to complete LCC
Vehicle Make (i.e.: Ford, Chevrolet, etc.): Ford
Vehicle Common Model Name (i.e.:Taurus, CK1500, Uplander, etc.): E350 Extended
Vehicle Exact Model Code (i.e.: R44, CC15653, RSKL52, etc.): S3B
Vehicle Trim Package Common Name (i.e.: XLT, SE, LT, etc.): XLT
Exact Trim Package Code Designation (i.e.: 617A, 25J, 2LT, 1WT, etc.): 723A
American Made (Yes/No):|Yes
EPA Highway MPG Rating (if applicable): |not rated
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