

**Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Sierra 1500, Titan, Ram 1500, Tundra, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 1 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | PKG 50\$ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.5</u> HP <u>282</u> Torque <u>253</u> E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 998 ✓ PPW |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | CG ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | PKG ✓ 85A |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | PKG ✓ 85A |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | PKG ✓ 52B |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors | | PKG ✓ 85A |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>.3.73</u> | | XL6 ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$20,171.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F150 |
| Exact Model Code: | | F1C |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 998 |
| Transmission Code: | | 446 |
| GVWR: | | 6100 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 1900 |
| Wheelbase: | | 141 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Sierra 1500, Titan, Ram 1500, Tundra, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 2 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|-------------------------|---|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 50S ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.5</u> HP <u>282</u> Torque <u>253</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 998 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | STD |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | 85A ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 85A ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 52B ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors | | 85A ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>.3.73</u> | | XL6 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | 53A ✓ |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 67T ✓ |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$20,691.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F150 |
| Exact Model Code: | | F1C |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 998 |
| Transmission Code: | | 446 |
| GVWR: | | 6100 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 1900 |
| Wheelbase: | | 141 |
| American Made: | | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No |

**Regular Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Silverado 1500, F150, Sierra 1500, Titan, Ram 1500, Tundra, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 2 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 50S ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.5</u> HP <u>282</u> Torque <u>253</u> E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 998 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | STD |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | PKG ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 85A ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 53M ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors | | 85A ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>.3.73</u> | | XL6 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | 53A ✓ |
| Line 21 - Integral Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 67T ✓ |
| Line 22 - DOT Orange Paint | | W5684E |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$21,122.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F150 |
| Exact Model Code: | | F1C |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 998 |
| Transmission Code: | | 446 |
| GVWR: | | 6100 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 1900 |
| Wheelbase: | | 141 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Regular Cab, 4x4, Long Box, Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 2500, F250, Ram 2500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 8 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|-----------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 525 ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.2</u> HP <u>385</u> Torque <u>405</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 996 ✓ <i>HPU YES</i> |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | 1S ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | TBM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | <i>1M ✓ 1/2-D ✓</i> 1/62D AMFM |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.73</u> . | | XL3 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 52B ✓ |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | 213 ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$25,664.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F250 |
| Exact Model Code: | | F2B |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 996 |
| Transmission Code: | | 44P |
| GVWR: | | 10000 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3580 |
| Wheelbase: | | 137 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Regular Cab, 4x4, Long Box, Diesel, HD Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 2500, F250, Ram 2500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 2 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 525 ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Turbocharged Diesel, minimum 6.6 liters. Must be rated minimum 395 Hp., minimum 760 lb/ft torque. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.7</u> HP <u>440</u> Torque <u>860</u> | | 99T ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | 1S ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | TBM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 90L |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 91M ✓ 585 ✓ 1/62D, AMFM ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.31</u> | | X3H ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD ✓ |
| Line 21 - Integral Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 52B ✓ |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | 213 ✓ |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$32,588.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F250 |
| Exact Model Code: | | F2B |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 99T |
| Transmission Code: | | 44W |
| GVWR: | | 10000 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 2920 |
| Wheelbase: | | 137 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Crew Cab, 4x4, Short Box, Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 2500, F250, Ram 2500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 1 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|-------------------------|---|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 525 |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.2</u> HP <u>385</u> Torque <u>405</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 996 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | 1S ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | TBM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD ✓ |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 91N, 585 ✓ 1-62D, AMFN ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.73</u> . | | XL6 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 52B ✓ |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | 213 ✓ |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$29,188.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F250 |
| Exact Model Code: | | W2B |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 996 |
| Transmission Code: | | 44P |
| GVWR: | | 10000 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3100 |
| Wheelbase: | | 156 |
| American Made: | | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No |

**Crew Cab, 4x4, Long Box, Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 2500, F250, Ram 2500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 2 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 525 |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.2</u> HP <u>385</u> Torque <u>405</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 996 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | 1S ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | TBM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | AM 585 ✓ 1/62D, AMFV |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DLR |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | 90L ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.73</u> . | | XL6 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integral Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | 52B ✓ |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | 213 ✓ |
| Line 23 - Snow Plow Prep package. Increased capacity front suspension and other components necessary for increased load caused by installation of a front snow plow | | 473 ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$29,488.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | F250 |
| Exact Model Code: | | W2B |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 996 |
| Transmission Code: | | 44P |
| GVWR: | | 10000 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 2980 |
| Wheelbase: | | 172 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Regular Cab, 4x4, Long Box, Auto Transmission, 10,100 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 3500, F350, Ram 3500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 2 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>360</u> Torque <u>380</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest <u>40/20/46</u> | | H2R ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | QGM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | IOB ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>4.10</u> . | | STD |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | STD |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | NQF ✓ |
| Line 23 - Snow Plow Prep package. Increased capacity front suspension and other components necessary for increased load caused by installation of a front snow plow | | VYU ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$27,752.24 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | SILVERADO |
| Exact Model Code: | | CK35903 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1WT |
| Engine Code: | | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYD |
| GVWR: | | 11,400 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3719 |
| Wheelbase: | | 133.6 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Extended Cab, 4x2, Long Box, Auto Transmission, 10,100 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 3500, F350, Ram 3500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 1 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|-------------------------|---|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>360</u> Torque <u>380</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | H2R ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | QWF ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | IOB ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI/5H1 ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>4.10</u> . | | STD |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | STD |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$27,376.94 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | SILVERADO |
| Exact Model Code: | | CC35953 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1WT |
| Engine Code: | | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYD |
| GVWR: | | 11,200 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3596 |
| Wheelbase: | | 158.1 |
| American Made: | | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No |

**Crew Cab, 4x4, Long Box, Auto Transmission, 10,500 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 3500, F350, Ram 3500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 3 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|-------------------------|---|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>360</u> Torque <u>380</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | H2R ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | QGM ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | IOB ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI/5H1 ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>4.10</u> . | | STD |
| Line 20 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | NQH ✓ |
| Line 21 - Snow Plow Prep package. Increased capacity front suspension and other components necessary for increased load caused by installation of a front snow plow | | VYU ✓ |
| Line 22 - DOT Orange Paint | | 9W4 ✓ |
| | | |
| | | |
| | | |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$31,385.09 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | SILVERADO |
| Exact Model Code: | | CK35943 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1WT |
| Engine Code: | | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYD |
| GVWR: | | 11,600 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 4108 |
| Wheelbase: | | 167.7 |
| American Made: | | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No |

**Crew Cab, 4x4, Long Box, DRW, Auto Transmission, 10,500 GVWR Min
(i.e. Silverado 3500, F350, Ram 3500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 4 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Rear Step bumper | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If V-8 engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>360</u> Torque <u>380</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | H2R ✓ |
| Line 9 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | QZT ✓ |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | IOB ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI/5H1 ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | PCR ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 19 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>4.10</u> . | | STD |
| Line 20 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 21 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | STD |
| Line 22 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | NQF ✓ |
| Line 23 - Snow Plow Prep package. Increased capicity front suspension and other components necessary for increased load caused by installation of a front snow plow | | VYU ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$31,735.39 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | SILVERADO |
| Exact Model Code: | | CK35943 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1WT |
| Engine Code: | | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYD |
| GVWR: | | 13,025 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 5796 |
| Wheelbase: | | 167.7 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Full Size Cargo Van, 2 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 8,550 GVWR Min
(i.e. Transit 150, Express 2500, NV1500, Promaster 1500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 6 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Roof Height not to exceed 84" | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | ZQ3 ✓ |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | ZQ3 ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>342</u> Torque <u>373</u> E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Full interior insulation/trim package, to include door/side wall panels, full headliner, dome lamp(s) & front bulk head. OEM preferred but upfitter is acceptable as long as the quality is indistinguishable from OEM. Front bucket seats w/arm rests and cloth upholstery. | | ✓ ADRIAN/AS5 |
| Line 9 - Full floor rubber covering throughout. Fitted rubber front floor mats. | | STD |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | ATG ✓ |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | UPF ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u> </u> | | ✓GU6/G80 ✓ |
| Line 18 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated | | DE5 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 20 - Privacy Glass | | STD |
| Line 21 - Rear Window Defroster | | C49 ✓ |
| Line 22 - Rear heater and air conditioner | | ✓C36/C69 ✓ |
| Line 23 - RH dual swinging doors | | STD |
| Line 24 - Rear Swinging Doors | | STD |
| Line 25 - Wheel Covers | | P03 ✓ |
| Line 26 - Windows All Around | | ZW6 ✓ |
| Line 27 - Rear step bumper | | STD |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$26,820.04 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | EXPRESS 2500 |
| Exact Model Code: | | CG23405 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1WT |
| Engine Code: | | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYD |
| GVWR: | | 8600 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3250 |
| Wheelbase: | | 135 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Full Size Cargo Van, 2 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 8,550 GVWR Min
(i.e. Transit 150, Express 2500, NV1500, Promaster 1500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 4 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|-------------------------|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Roof Height minimum of 100.7" | | E1C ✓ |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD ✓ |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 60C ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 5 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.7</u> HP <u>275</u> Torque <u>260</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 998 — 99M 610 |
| Line 7 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 8 - Full interior insulation/trim package, to include door/side wall panels, full headliner, dome lamp(s) & front bulk head. OEM preferred but upfitter is acceptable as long as the quality is indistinguishable from OEM. Front bucket seats w/arm rests and cloth upholstery. | | DLR |
| Line 9 - Full floor rubber covering throughout. Fitted rubber front floor mats. | | DLR |
| Line 10 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 11 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | STD |
| Line 14 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 58X ✓ |
| Line 15 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | 86F ✓ |
| Line 16 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 17 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.73</u> . | | X7L ✓ |
| Line 18 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated | | 542 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Privacy Glass | | 92E ✓ |
| Line 21 - Rear Window Defroster | | 92E ✓ 57M ✓ |
| Line 22 - Rear heater and air conditioner | | 57G ✓ |
| Line 23 - Dual Sliding Side Doors | | E1D ✓ |
| Line 24 - Rear Swinging Doors | | STD |
| Line 25 - Wheel Covers | | ENTER COVER ✓ |
| Line 26 - Rear step bumper | | STD |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$27,998.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | TRANSIT |
| Exact Model Code: | | E1D |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 99M |
| Transmission Code: | | 446 |
| GVWR: | | 8600 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 3550 |

**Full Size Cargo Van, 2 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 8,550 GVWR Min
(i.e. Transit 150, Express 2500, NV1500, Promaster 1500, etc.)**

| | | | | |
|--|-----------------------|------------------------------|--|-----|
| | | | Wheelbase: | |
| | American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes | <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | 130 |

**Full Size Window Van, 8 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 8,550 GVWR Min
(i.e. Transit 150, Promaster 2500, NV1500, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 1 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|----------------------------|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | 60C ✓ |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>6</u> Liters <u>3.7</u> HP <u>275</u> Torque <u>260</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | 99M ✓ <i>FPU</i> |
| Line 6 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 7 - Full interior insulation/trim package, to include door/side wall panels, full headliner, dome lamp(s). | | STD |
| Line 8 - Full floor rubber covering throughout. Fitted rubber front floor mats. | | STD |
| Line 9 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 10 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 11 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | STD |
| Line 13 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | 58X ✓ <i>60C 85C</i> |
| Line 14 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | 86F ✓ |
| Line 15 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 16 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.73</u> . | | X7L ✓ |
| Line 17 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated | | 542 ✓ |
| Line 18 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | 942 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Privacy Glass | | 92E ✓ |
| Line 20 - Rear Window Defroster | | STD ✓ |
| Line 21 - Rear heater and air conditioner | <i>SHIP 57N to bid</i> | 57N ✓ |
| Line 22 - RH dual swinging doors | | K1Z ✓ |
| Line 23 - Rear Swinging Doors | | STD ✓ |
| Line 24 - Eight passenger seating. Front captain chair seats, two quick-release 3-passenger bench seats directly behind, all with cloth upholstery. Folding arm rests on both captains chairs and all 3-passenger seats on door end, if available. | | STD ✓ |
| Line 25 - Windows all around | | STD ✓ |
| Line 26 - Rear step bumper | | STD ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$24,978.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$3.00 |
| Vendor Name: | | STIVERS |
| Vehicle Make: | | FORD |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | TRANSIT |
| Exact Model Code: | | K1Z ✓ <i>OK</i> |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | XL |
| Engine Code: | | 99M |
| Transmission Code: | | 446 |
| GVWR: | | 8550 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 2930 |

**Full Size Window Van, 8 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 8,550 GVWR Min
(i.e. Transit 150, Promaster 2500, NV1500, etc.)**

| | | |
|----------------|---|-----|
| | Wheelbase: | 130 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |

**Extended Window Van, 15 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Express 3500, Ford T350, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 5 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|---|-------------------------|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Wheelbase: 147 inches minimum | | STD |
| Line 2 - Roof Height not to exceed 84" | | STD |
| Line 3 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 4 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 5 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 6 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 7 - Engine: Standard engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>6.0</u> HP <u>342</u> Torque <u>373</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L96 ✓ |
| Line 8 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 9 - Full interior insulation/trim package, to include door/side wall panels, full headliner, dome lamp(s). Front bucket seats w/cloth upholstery | | STD |
| Line 10 - Full floor rubber covering throughout. Fitted rubber front floor mats. | | 5B8 ✓ |
| Line 11 - Tires, all-season radial | | STD |
| Line 12 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 13 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 14 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | STD |
| Line 15 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | UPF ✓ |
| Line 16 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | 5H1 & DI ✓ |
| Line 17 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 18 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u> </u> | | G80 ✓ |
| Line 19 - Power Exterior Mirrors, heated | | DE5 ✓ |
| Line 20 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 21 - Privacy Glass | | STD |
| Line 22 - Rear Window Defroster | | C49 ✓ |
| Line 23 - Rear heater and air conditioner | | STD |
| Line 24 - RH dual swinging doors | | STD |
| Line 25 - Rear Swinging Doors | | STD |
| Line 26 - Windows all around | | STD |
| Line 27 - Back up camera | | UVC ✓ |
| Line 28 - Rear step bumper | | STD |
| Line 29 - OEM required running boards with matching front and rear (behind tires) mudflaps. No dealer logo on mudflaps. Dealer installed is acceptable if OEM is not available. | | DI ✓ |
| Line 30 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | Z82 ✓ |
| Line 31 - Integrel Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | DI ✓ |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$29,999.00 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | BOB BROWN CHEV |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVY |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | EXPRESS |
| Exact Model Code: | | 1LT |

**Extended Window Van, 15 Passenger, Auto Transmission, 9,000 GVWR Min
(i.e. Express 3500, Ford T350, etc.)**

| | |
|------------------------|--|
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | 1LT |
| Engine Code: | L96 |
| Transmission Code: | MYD |
| GVWR: | 9600 |
| Payload Capacity: | 3018 |
| Wheelbase: | 155 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No |

**Large SUV, 4x4, 9 Passenger, 4 Door, V-8, Automatic Transmission
(i.e. Suburban, Yukon, Expedition, etc.)**

| Vehicle Minimum Specifications | Estimated Qty: 9 | Pkg, Code, NA, or STD |
|--|---|------------------------------|
| Line 1 - Air conditioning | | STD |
| Line 2 - Tilt and/or Telescoping Steering Column | | STD |
| Line 3 - Automatic Speed Control | | STD |
| Line 4 - Intermittent Wipers | | STD |
| Line 6 - Engine: V-8 engine for vehicle bid. If standard engine is available as E85 Flex-fuel, it must be provided. PROVIDE: Cylinders <u>8</u> Liters <u>5.3</u> HP <u>355</u> Torque <u>383</u> . E-85 <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Yes <input type="checkbox"/> No | | L83 ✓ <i>flex yes</i> |
| Line 6 - Power 4-wheel anti-lock brakes | | STD |
| Line 7 - Interior trim package w/insulating headliner, full door and back of cab panels, dome lamp. Split bench seat w/cloth upholstery, folding center armrest | | ✓ AZ3/HOU ✓ |
| Line 8 - Full floor covering, rubber required-if available it must be provided. If floor covering must be carpet, OEM floor mats must be provided. | | STD |
| Line 9 - Tires, all-terrain radial (all-season NOT acceptable) | | STD |
| Line 10 - Spare tire, Full Size or Compact acceptable <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Fullsize <input type="checkbox"/> Compact | | STD |
| Line 11 - Power windows | | STD |
| Line 12 - Power door locks with remote keyless entry | | STD |
| Line 13 - Bluetooth OEM installed required if available. Dealer installed acceptable if not available from OEM | | STD ✓ |
| Line 14 - 2 Extra key sets with fobs for 4 total complete sets with each vehicle | | DI/5HP ✓ |
| Line 15 - Stability Control System | | STD |
| Line 16 - Power Trailer Tow Exterior Mirrors | | STD |
| Line 17 - Automatic Daytime Running Lights | | STD |
| Line 18 - Limited Slip/Locking Differential PROVIDE: Ratio <u>3.08</u> . | | STD |
| Line 19 - Trailer tow package: Class IV receiver hitch, 2-inch shaft. 7-wire trailer wiring receptacle at hitch. | | STD |
| Line 20 - Integral Brake Controller, OEM Required if available but Dealer Installed Acceptable | | DI |
| Line 21 - Electronic Shift-on-the-Fly Transfer Case | | NQH ✓ |
| Line 22 - Rear Window Defroster and Wiper/Washer | | STD |
| Line 23 - Rear heater and air conditioner | | STD |
| *If bidder chooses not to bid this vehicle they must enter NO BID in the cell to the right: | | |
| Delivered Vehicle Price to DOT or Regents Location: | | \$41,524.93 |
| Per Mile Delivery Charge to any other Political Subdivision: | | \$1.50 |
| Vendor Name: | | KARL CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Make: | | CHEVROLET |
| Vehicle Model Name: | | SUBURBAN |
| Exact Model Code: | | CK15906 |
| Trim pkg. Common Name: | | 1FL |
| Engine Code: | | L83 |
| Transmission Code: | | MYC |
| GVWR: | | 7500 |
| Payload Capacity: | | 1692 |
| Wheelbase: | | 130 |
| American Made: | <input type="checkbox"/> Yes <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> No | |